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NOTICE OF AWARD

February 13, 2024

Ms. Arlinda S. Perez
Proprietor

Arxmedica Marketing
#78 F Laurena St.
Tanauan City, Batangas

Dear MS. PEREZ:

We are notifying you that your Bid dated February 06, 2024, for Lot 4 for the
Procurement of Assorted Office and Other Supplies with Ref. # 2024-01-01 for the
contract price as calculated of FOUR HUNDRED FORTY-FIVE THOUSAND TWO
HUNDRED TEN PESOS (P445,210.00) is hereby accepted.

You are hereby required to provide within ten (10) days upon receipt hereof the
performance security in the form and amount stipulated in the Instructions to Bidders.
Failure to provide the required performance security shall constitute sufficient ground
for cancellation of the award and forfeiture of the bid security.

Thank you and our best regards.
Very truly yours,
f‘\M ey G.

ATTY. LUCIEDEN }AZ
Director llll and OIC, OD

Conforme:
ARLINDA .PE&
Owher/Manager

Signature over Printed Name
Name of the Winning Bidder
Date of receipt_Februay 33, 2024’
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ENRI BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

RESOLUTION # 2024-02-05

Project: Procurement of Assorted Office and Other Supplies with Ref. #
2024-01-01

WHEREAS, the Food and Nutrition Research Institute (FNRI) advertised the Invitation
to Bid for the Procurement of Assorted Office and Other Supplies by posting in the
PhilGEPS. FNRI website and in the different conspicuous places within the DOST
System and the FNRI premises for seven (7) calendar days;

WHEREAS, in response to the said advertisements, six (6) bidders purchased the
Bidding Documents;

WHEREAS, said bidders submitted their bids and passed the preliminary examination
of the Bids by the FNRI BAC - TWG, and their financial documents were opened;

WHEREAS, the bid proposals indicated below were found to be substantially
complying with all the technical requirements and specifications needed for the
Procurement of Assorted Office and Other Supplies;

‘T.ot Abstract of Bids as Read (in ®) l ABC l Variance from
# the ABC
Lambert Bitsoftechn | RCJ Trading Arxmedica MCSA DVK Phils.
Trading ology Co. & General | Marketing Marketing Enterprise
Merchandise s
1 648,523.00 No Bid 639.330.00 | NoBid 601,256.10 | 718,888.80 | 803,780.00 Lambert-19.32%
RCJ-20.46%
\ \ \ MCSA-25.20% J
DVK-10.56%
2 No Bid 1,877,351.00 | 1,824,430.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid Bitsoftechnology
, 2.213,800.00 | -15.20%
RCJ-17.59%
|3 | NoBid | NoBid 16301600 | NoBid | NoBid No Bid 180,494.00 | RCJ-9.68% |
P l No Bid ‘ No Bid No Bid \ 445210.00 ‘ No Bid No Bid 451,440.00 ‘ Arxmedica- J
1.38%
E l No Bid 1 No Bid 1,935,840.00 \ No Bid ‘ 1,711,884.00 l No Bid 2,256,500.00 \ RCJ-14.21% J
MCSA-24.14%
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WHEREAS, the detailed evaluation of bid conducted resulted in the following:

Lot \ Abstract of Bids as Calculated (in ?) \ ABC Variance from
p the ABC
Lambert Bitsoftechn | RCJ Trading Arxmedica MCSA DVK Phils.
Trading ology Co. & General | Marketing Marketing Enterprise
Merchandise s
1 648,523.00 No Bid 539,330.00 No Bid 601,256.10 | 718,888.80 803,780.00 | Lambert-19.32%
RCJ-20.46%
MCSA-25.20%
DVK-10.56%
) No Bid 1,877,351.00 | 1,824,430.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid T Bitsoftechnology
2,213,800.00 | -15.20%
RCJ-17.59%
3 | NoBid | NoBid | 163,016.00 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid [ 180,494.00 | RCJ-9.68%
4 \ No Bid \ No Bid No Bid ( 445,210.00 ‘ No Bid ‘ No Bid ) 451,440.00 ’ Arxmedica- J
1.38%
5 ‘ No Bid l No Bid ‘ 1,935,840.00 No Bid \ 1,711,884.00 | No Bid 2,256,500.00 | RCJ-14.21%
L MCSA-24.14%

WHEREAS, upon careful examination, validation and verification of all the eligibility,
technical and financial requirements, the bid of the following for the Procurement of
Assorted Office and Other Supplies are within the Approved Budget for the Contract
(ABC) and found to be responsive as per attached detailed post evaluation and
recommendation by the FNRI BAC Technical Working Group for Goods and Services:

1. MCSA Marketing is the Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bid for Lots 1 and 5
amounting to TWO MILLION THREE HUNDRED THIRTEEN THOUSAND

ONE HUNDRED FORTY PESOS and 10/100 (P2,313,140.10);

2 RCJ Trading and General Merchandise is the Lowest Calculated and
Responsive Bid for Lot 2 and Single Calculated and Responsive Bid for Lot 3
amounting to ONE MILLION NINE HUNDRED EIGHTY-SEVEN THOUSAND

FOUR HUNDRED FORTY-SIX PESOS (P1,987,446.00); and

3. Arxmedica Marketing is the Single Calculated and Responsive Bid for Lot 4
amounting to FOUR HUNDRED FORTY-FIVE THOUSAND TWO HUNDRED

TEN PESOS (P445,210.00);

NOW THEREFORE, We the members of the Bids and Awards Committee, hereby
resolve as it is hereby resolved:

a. To declare the bid of MCSA Marketing as the Lowest Calculated and
Responsive Bid for Lots 1 and 5 amounting to TWO MILLION THREE
HUNDRED THIRTEEN THOUSAND ONE HUNDRED FORTY PESOS and

10/100 (P2,313,140.10);

b. To declare the bid of RCJ Trading and General Merchandise as the Lowest
Calculated and Responsive Bid for Lot 2 and Single Calculated and Responsive
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Bid for Lot 3 amounting to ONE MILLION NINE HUNDRED EIGHTY-SEVEN
THOUSAND FOUR HUNDRED FORTY-SIX PESOS (P1,987,446.00);

c. To declare the bid of Arxmedica Marketing as the Single Calculated and
Responsive Bid for Lot 3 amounting to FOUR HUNDRED FORTY-FIVE
THOUSAND TWO HUNDRED TEN PESOS (P445,210.00); and

d. To recommend for the approval by the Director of the Food and Nutrition
Research Institute the foregoing findings.

RESOLVED this 12t day of February 2024.

BAC Chairperson

absent %&r\
MS. CHARMAINE A. DUANTE MR. DAVE P. BRIONES
BAC Vice-Chairperson BAC Member

ool R
MS. JO S. MEDINA

BAC Member

MR. MARLON O. BALITAON

End-User

Approved by:

Airiand - R
ATTY. LUCIEDEN G.RAZ

Director 111
Officer-in-Charge, Office of the
Director

Approved on




