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NOTICE OF AWARD

Ms. Myra E. Garcia

Territory Manager

Omnibus Bio-Medical Systems, Inc.
4F, Wilson Corporate Center
Greenhills, San Juan City

Dear MS. GARCIA:

We are notifying you that your Bid dated August 7, 2024, for Lot 1 of the Procurement
of Assorted Laboratory Services with Ref. # 2024-07-09 for the contract price as
calculated of SEVEN HUNDRED EIGHTY-SEVEN THOUSAND PESOS
(P787,000.00) is hereby accepted.

You are hereby required to provide within ten (10) days upon receipt hereof the
performance security in the form and amount stipulated in the Instructions to Bidders.
Failure to provide the required performance security shall constitute sufficient ground
for cancellation of the award and forfeiture of the bid security.

Thank you and our best regards.

Very truly yours,

o bt 1

Deputy Dlrectorl irector ||
Officer-in-Charge, Office of the Director

Co forme:‘
AW A |
Ay cANM/a

Signature over Printed Name
Name of the Winning Bidder
Date of receipt: 4~ |l» - mUJ_

“Fight Mainutrition with Accurate Data, Correct information and Innovative Technologies”
Tel. #: 837-2934, 837-1839. 837-2071 to 82 loc. 2296
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FNRI BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

RESOLUTION # 2024-08-19

Procurement of Assorted Laboratory Equipment with Ref. # 2024-
07-09

Project:

WHEREAS, the Food and Nutrition Research Institute (FNRI) advertised the Invitation
to Bid for the Procurement of Assorted Laboratory Equipment by posting in the
PhilGEPS, FNRI website and in the different conspicuous places within the DOST
System and the FNRI premises for seven (7) calendar days;

WHEREAS, in response to the said advertisements, four (4) bidders purchased the
Bidding Documents;

WHEREAS, said bidders submitted their bid and passed the preliminary examination
of the Bids by the FNRI BAC — TWG, and their financial documents were opened;

WHEREAS, the bid proposals indicated below were found to be substantially
complying with all the technical requirements and specifications needed for the
Procurement of Assorted Laboratory Equipment;
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ot Abstract of Bids as Read
> = - - Variance from
Omnibus Bio- | rg gejence | Medical Test | ainphil Inc. R the ABC
Moical Phils., Inc Systems, Inc.
Systems, Inc. o '
1 787,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 800,000.00 | 1.63%
2 No Bid 980,000.00 No Bid 738,300.00 | 1,000,000.00 |ITS-2%
Rainphil-26.17%
3 No Bid 2,418,000.00 2,500,000.00 No Bid 3,000,000.00 |{I1TS-19.40%
Medtest-16.67%
WHEREAS, the detailed evaluation of bid conducted resulted in the following:
Lot .
# Abstract of Bids as Caiculated
z - 2 = Variance from
Ommbtfs Bio- ITS Sci Medical Test Rainphil Inc. ABC the ABC
Modvcal Phils., In i
Systems, Inc. » INC. Systems, Inc.
1 787,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 800,000.00 | 1.63%
2 No Bid 980,000.00 No Bid Non- 1,000,000.00 | ITS2%
Compliant
%] No Bid Non-Compliant 2,500,000.00 No Bid 3,000,000.00 | ITS-19.40%
| Medtest-16.67%
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WHEREAS, upon careful examination, validation and verification of all the eligibility,
technical and financial requirements, the bid of the following for the Procurement of
Assorted Laboratory Equipment is within the Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)
and found to be responsive as per attached detailed post evaluation and
recommendation by the FNRI BAC Technical Working Group for Goods and Services:

1. Omnibus Bio-Medical Systems, Inc. is the Single Calculated and Responsive
Bid for Lot 1 amounting to SEVEN HUNDRED EIGHTY-SEVEN THOUSAND
PESOS (P787,000.00);

2. ITS Science Phils., Inc. is the Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bid for Lot 2
amounting to NINE HUNDRED EIGHTY THOUSAND PESOS (P980,000.00);
and

3. Medical Test Systems, Inc. is the Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bid for
Lot 3 amounting to TWO MILLION FIVE HUNDRED THOUSAND PESOS
(P2,500,000.00)

NOW THEREFORE, We the members of the Bids and Awards Committee, hereby
resolve as it is hereby resolved:

a. To declare the bid of Omnibus Bio-Medical Systems, Inc. as the Single
Calculated and Responsive Bid for Lot 1 amounting to SEVEN HUNDRED
EIGHTY-SEVEN THOUSAND PESOS (P787,000.00);

b. To declare the bid of ITS Science Phils., Inc. as the Lowest Calculated and

Responsive Bid for Lot 2 amounting to NINE HUNDRED EIGHTY THOUSAND
PESOS (P980,000.00);

c. To declare the bid of Medical Test Systems, Inc. as the Lowest Calculated
and Responsive Bid for Lot 3 amounting to TWO MILLION FIVE HUNDRED
THOUSAND PESOS (P2,500,000.00);

d. To recommend for the approval by the Director of the Food and Nutrition
Research Institute the foregoing findings.
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DOST-FNRI

RESOLVED this 29t day of August 2024.
MR. ALEXIS M. ORTIZ
BAC Chairperson
i

MS. QHARWE(‘. DUANTE MR. DAVE P. BRIONES
BAC Vice-Chairperson BAC Member
Gt -

MS. M ERYL C. VELASCO MS. ] . MEDINA

BAC Member BAC Member

Approved by:

‘ . R
ATTY. L%&@f)k G.[RAZ
Deputy Director/Director III
Officer-in-Charge, Office of the
Director
Approved on




