P

T-FNRI

Republic of the Philippines
Department of Science and Technology

FOOD AND NUTRITION RESEARCH INSTITUTE

General Santos Avenue, Bicutan, Taguig City, Philippines

LIS

O

B

. \\
Py AW

.
Crrppsct

NOTICE OF AWARD

Ms. Jennifer M. Berdum
Authorized Representative

Krypton International Resources Sales and Services Inc.

6015 Canjulao 2nd, Lapu—Lapu City,
Central Visayas

Dear MS. BERDUM:

(A

BAGONG PILIPINAS

We are notifying you that your Bid dated August 21, 2024, for Lot 3 of the Procurement
of Assorted Laboratory Supplies with Ref. # 2024-07-10 for the contract price as
calculated of TWO HUNDRED SEVENTY-ONE THOUSAND SIX HUNDRED
TWENTY PESOS (P271,620.00) is hereby accepted.

You are hereby required to provide within ten (10) days upon receipt hereof the
performance security in the form and amount stipulated in the Instructions to Bidders.
Failure to provide the required performance security shall constitute sufficient ground
for cancellation of the award and forfeiture of the bid security.

Thank you and our best regards.

Very truly yours,

ATTY. L%{%?N?é.ﬁiz

Deputy Director/Director Il § g""m/

Officer-in-Charge, Office of the Director
F o

!
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JEN K M bprduly

Signature over Printed Name
Name of the Winning Bidder
Date of receipt;__[] SEIT- WA)—ll

“Fight Mainutrition with Accurate Data, Correct Info

‘.-_i ¥ ""*1,' o ;. 4 a0 [ ;
Tel #: 837-2934, 837-1838, 837

"t

"’?crI’DI“ and Innovative Technologies”




Department of Science and Technology < - E é | 1508001201
FOOD AND NUTRITION RESEARCH INSTITUTE 51 i 5 ‘ rumm
General Santos Avenue, Bicutan, Taguig City, Philippines Q*I'Pr-,..;«\* ! B o mosset N i

FNRI BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

RESOLUTION # 2024-08-22

Procurement of Assorted Laboratory Supplies with Ref. # 2024-07-
10

Project:

WHEREAS, the Food and Nutrition Research Institute (FNRI) advertised the Invitation
to Bid for the Procurement of Assorted Laboratory Supplies by posting in the
PhilGEPS, FNRI website and in the different conspicuous places within the DOST
System and the FNRI premises for seven (7) calendar days;

WHEREAS, in response to the said advertisements, seven (7) bidders purchased the
Bidding Documents;

WHEREAS, said bidders submitted their bid and passed the preliminary examination
of the Bids by the FNRI BAC — TWG, and their financial documents were opened;

WHEREAS, the bid proposals indicated below were found to be substantially

complying with all the technical requirements and specifications needed for the
Procurement of Assorted Laboratory Supplies;

Lot Abstract of Bids as Read ABC Variance
b from
the ABC
Labtraders, | Rainphil Yana Chemline Krypton RCJ Scientific
Inc. Inc. Chemoditi | Scientific Int’l Trading & | Biotech
es, Corp. Resources | Gen. Special-
inc. Sales & Merchan- ties, Inc.
Services, dise
Inc.
1 No Bid No Bid No Bid 191,250.00 No Bid 158,800.00 No Bid 191,250.00 | Chemiline-
0%
RCJ-
16.97%
2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 369,500.00 | -
3 No Bid No Bid No Bid 283,220.00 | 271,620.00 No Bid No Bid 283,500.00 | Chemline-
0.1%
Krypton-
4.19%
4 No Bid No Bid No Bid 407,662.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 407,800.00 | 0.03%
5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 94,000.00 -
6 No Bid No Bid 706,003.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 706,705.00 | 0.1%
7 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 191,986.00 | 192,186.00 | 0.1%
8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 271,000.00 | -
9 168,000.00 | 127,000.00 | 139,720.00 | 170,000.00 | 168,142.00 No Bid No Bid 170,000.00 | Labtraders
-1.18%
Rainphil-
25.29%
Chemline-
0%
Krypton-
1 NQo%L
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10 No Bid 190,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 190,000.00 | Rainphil-
0%
11 No Bid No Bid No Bid 42 000.00 50,340.00 No Bid No Bid 55,000.00 Chemline-
23.64%
Krypton-
8.47%
WHEREAS, the detailed evaluation of bid conducted resulted in the following:
Lot Abstract of Bids as Calculated ABC Variance
# from
the ABC
Labtraders, | Rainphil Yana Chemline Krypton RCJ Scientific
Inc. Inc. Chemoditi | Scientific Int’l Trading & Biotech
es, Corp. Resources | Gen. Special-
Inc. Sales & Merchan- ties, Inc.
Services, dise
inc.
1 No Bid No Bid No Bid 191,250.00 No Bid 158,800.00 No Bid 191,250.00 | Chemline-
0%
RCJ-
16.97%
2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 369,500.00 | -
3 No Bid No Bid NoBid | 283,220.00 | 271,62000 | NoBid No Bid 283,500.00 | Chemline-
0.1%
Krypton-
4.19%
4 No Bid No Bid No Bid 407.662.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 407,800.00 | 0.03%
5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 94,000.00 -
6 No Bid No Bid 706,003.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 706,705.00 | 0.1%
7 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 191,986.00 | 192,186.00 | 0.1%
8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 271,000.00 | -
9 168,000.00 127,000.00 | 139,720.00 | 170,000.00 | 168,142.00 No Bid No Bid 170,000.00 | Labtraders
-1.18%
Rainphil-
25.29%
Chemline-
0%
Krypton-
1.09%
10 No Bid 190,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 190,000.00 | Rainphil-0
1 No Bid No Bid No Bid 42 000.00 50,340.00 No Bid No Bid 55,000.00 Chemline-
23.64%
Krypton-
8.47%

WHEREAS, upon careful examination, validation and verification of all the eligibility,
technical and financial requirements, the bid of the following for the Procurement of
Assorted Laboratory Supplies is within the Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)
and found to be responsive as per attached detailed post evaluation and
recommendation by the FNRI BAC Technical Working Group for Goods and Services:

1. Chemline Scientific Corporation is the Single Calculated and Responsive Bid
for Lot 4 amounting to FOUR HUNDRED SEVEN THOUSAND SIX HUNDRED
SIXTY-TWO PESOS (P407,662.00) and the Lowest Calculated and
Responsive Bid for Lot 11 amounting to FORTY-TWO THOUSAND PESOS
(P42,000.00);
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RCJ Trading and General Merchandise is the Lowest Calculated and
Responsive Bid for Lot 1 amounting to ONE HUNDRED FIFTY-EIGHT
THOUSAND EIGHT HUNDRED PESOS (P158,800.00);

Krypton Int'l Resources Sales & Services, Inc. is the Lowest Calculated and
Responsive Bid for Lot 3 amounting to TWO HUNDRED SEVENTY-ONE
THOUSAND SIX HUNDRED TWENTY PESOQOS (P271,620.00),

Yana Chemodities, Inc. is the Single Calculated and Responsive Bid for Lot 6
amounting to SEVEN HUNDRED SIX THOUSAND THREE PESOS
(®706,003.00);

Scientific Biotech Specialties, Inc. is the Single Calculated and Responsive Bid
for Lot 7 amounting to ONE HUNDRED NINETY-ONE THOUSAND NINE
HUNDRED EIGHTY-SIX PESOS (P191,986.00);

Labtraders, Inc. is the Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bid for Lot 9
amounting to ONE HUNDRED SIXTY-EIGHT THOUSAND PESOS
(®168,000.00); and

Rainphil, Inc. is the Single Calculated and Responsive Bid for Lot 10 amounting
to ONE HUNDRED NINETY THOUSAND PESOS (P190,000.00).

NOW THEREFORE, We the members of the Bids and Awards Committee, hereby
resolve as it is hereby resolved:

To declare the bid of Chemline Scientific Corporation is the Single Calculated
and Responsive Bid for Lot 4 amounting to FOUR HUNDRED SEVEN
THOUSAND SIX HUNDRED SIXTY-TWO PESOS (P407,662.00) and the
Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bid for Lot 11 amounting to FORTY-TWO
THOUSAND PESOS (P42,000.00);

To declare the bid of RCJ Trading and General Merchandise is the Lowest
Calculated and Responsive Bid for Lot 1 amounting to ONE HUNDRED FIFTY-
EIGHT THOUSAND EIGHT HUNDRED PESOS (P158,800.00);

To declare the bid of Krypton Int'| Resources Sales & Services, Inc. is the
Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bid for Lot 3 amounting to TWO HUNDRED
SEVENTY-ONE THOUSAND SIX HUNDRED TWENTY PESOS
(P271,620.00);

To declare the bid of Yana Chemodities, Inc. is the Single Calculated and
Responsive Bid for Lot 6 amounting to SEVEN HUNDRED SIX THOUSAND
THREE PESOS (P706,003.00);

To declare the bid of Scientific Biotech Specialties, Inc. is the Single Calculated
and Responsive Bid for Lot 7 amounting to ONE HUNDRED NINETY-ONE
THOUSAND NINE HUNDRED EIGHTY-SIX PESOS (P191,986.00);

BAGONG PILIPINAS
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f. To declare the bid of Labtraders, Inc. is the Lowest Calculated and Responsive
Bid for Lot 9 amounting to ONE HUNDRED SIXTY-EIGHT THOUSAND
PESOS (P168,000.00); and

g. To declare the bid of Rainphil, Inc. is the Single Calculated and Responsive Bid
for Lot 10 amounting to ONE HUNDRED NINETY THOUSAND PESOS
(190,000.00).

h. To declare failure of bid for Lots 2, 5 and 8 be subjected to small-valued
procurement; and

i. To recommend for the approval by the Director of the Food and Nutrition
Research Institute the foregoing findings.

RESOLVED this 30" day of August 2024.

BAC Chairperson

absent ;&M,m.-n

MS. CHARMAINE A. DUANTE MR. DAVE P. BRIONES
BAC Vice-Chairperson BAC Member

MS. MA( :;éYL C. VELASCO MS. ,;;15 g MEDINA
BAC Member BAC Member

Approved by:

ATTY. LUCIEDEV RAZ

Deputy Director/Director III
Officer-in-Charge, Office of the
Director
Approved on




